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gameplay debuted at the 2005 ElectronicÂ .The present invention relates to a

PCM digital transmission system and particularly to a PCM digital
transmission system for transmitting encoded digital data between digital units.

This PCM digital transmission system is used for the transmission of digital
audio data and is to permit the transmission of such data at an extremely high
fidelity. For example, the PCM digital transmission system is used to transmit

an audio data signal, which carries a signal having been encoded into PCM
digital data by an audio encoder, in order to re-encode the PCM data into a

format which is more suitable for the transmission. In such PCM digital
transmission systems, the PCM data to be transmitted are transmitted in a TDM

(Time Division Multiplex) manner so as to permit the transmission of a
plurality of PCM signals. The above-mentioned PCM digital transmission

system is disclosed, for example, in U.S. Pat. No. 4,139,888 and in U.S. patent
application Ser. No. 673,719. A conventional PCM digital transmission system
of the above-mentioned type is constructed such that, as shown in FIG. 1, each
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of one digital unit 2 and another digital unit 4 has a sub-bus 1 which is
connected to a main bus 3 through an interface circuit 5. Therefore, the PCM

digital data to be transmitted between these digital units 2 and 4 are transmitted
through these interfaces 5 to the main buses 3 to be subjected to the PCM

encoding processing. Thus, the PCM digital data are transmitted over the main
bus 3, and the transmission speed is considerably lower than that of the main
buses 3. Moreover, it is required to comprise a large number of interfaces 5,
resulting in the increase of the production cost. Further, if it is intended to
transmit data of a large capacity, a large number of digital units 2, 4 are
required, and hence the bus width must be increased.The committee, by

contrast, believes the case for abolishing
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aÂ .Vibrational spectroscopic studies of the interactions of carbendazim
fungicide with Langmuir films and oil/water interface. A Vibrometric titration

combined with thin-film studies of the interaction between carbendazim
fungicide and Langmuir films of octadecane and n-octanol was performed. The
Langmuir isotherms of the fungicide at the air-water interface were measured

by the surface pressure method using a Wilhelmy balance. The vibrational
spectra of a Langmuir film of octadecane and a Langmuir film of octanol with
and without carbendazim were investigated by the attenuated total reflection-
Fourier transform infrared spectroscopy (ATR-FTIR). The results obtained

revealed that carbendazim interacts mainly with the -CH2- and -CH3 groups of
the octadecane and octanol molecules, resulting in a change of surface pressure

values of the Langmuir films, which can be correlated to the hydrating
properties of the fungicide. Furthermore, the IR studies revealed that the

carbendazim molecules were preferably located at the interface between the
organic solvent phase and the aqueous solution. The IR spectrum of a

Langmuir monolayer of octadecane and octanol in the absence and presence of
carbendazim exhibited the presence of 3e33713323
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